

IFB-19011 OIL GREASE

| IFB-19011 OIL AND GREASE | CERTIFIED LABORATORIES | TRI-CON INC |
|--|---------------------------|----------------|
| DESCRIPTION | | |
| 1 | | |
| Anti-freeze, in gallon container (6ea 1gal/case) | NO BID | \$8.99 |
| No pre-Ready, Must be straight Anti Freeze | | GALLON |
| Autoguard, NO SUBSTITUTIONS | | 6/1 GL CS |
| | | |
| 2 | | |
| Grease, multi-purpose, red high temp. in tubes | \$4.06 | \$4.95 |
| (10-14 oz tubes/case), Royal 876 Grease | 194.95 CS | 49.50 CS |
| NO SUBSTITUTIONS | 48 TUBES/CS | 10/14 OZ CASE |
| | | |
| 3 | | |
| K-1 Kerosene, in drum (55 gals/drum) | NO BID | \$6.49 |
| Valero. Sub must be approved by Orange County | | GALLON |
| 4 | | |
| HD Engine Oil, single weight – 30, | NO BID | \$2.9183 |
| Quart containers – (12 qts/cs.) | | QUART |
| API-SJ; C14-30, Royal D/S Supreme 30, | | 12/1 QT CS |
| Sub must be approved by Orange County | | |
| 5 | | |
| HD Engine Oil, API C14-15W/40 | NO BID | \$12.20 GL |
| Drum containers (55 gals/drum) | | GALLON |
| Rottela 2 1540, | | |
| NO SUBSTITUTION | | |
| 6 | | |
| Hydraulic Oil, EP; A W -5k, Drum containers | \$12.07 | \$9.85 GL |
| (55 gals/drum) | GALLON | GALLON |
| Royal, Rozer 68, | | |
| Sub must be approved by Orange County | | |
| 7 | | |
| Automatic Transmission Fluid | NO BID | \$3.33 |
| Quart containers – (12 qts/cs.) | | QUART |
| Mercon/Dexron III | | 12/1 QT CS |
| Royal Multi Tran ATF | | |
| Sub must be approved by Orange County | | |
| | | |
| | | |

IFB-19011 OIL GREASE

| IFB-19011 OIL AND GREASE | | |
|--|------------------------|-----------------------|
| DESCRIPTION | CERTIFIED LABORATORIES | TRI-CON INC |
| 8 | | |
| Transmission & Drive Train Oil, T04-30, in drum (55 gals/drum) | \$18.37 GALLON | \$10.07 GALLON |
| Royal Tran & Drive Train 30 | | |
| NO SUBSTITUTIONS | | |
| 9 | | |
| DES, Diesel Exhaust Fluid, 2-1/2 Gallon, Sub must be approved by Orange County | NO BID | \$18.50 2.5 GALLON |
| 10 | | |
| HD Engine Oil, multiviscosity – 5W20, Sub must be approved by Orange County | NO BID | \$3.46 QUART |
| 11 | | |
| TRANSYND TES 295 SYSTHETIC FLUID sub must be approved by Orange County | \$31.56 GALLON | NO BID |
| 12 | | |
| BLUE DEF DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID NO SUBSTITUTIONS | NO BID | NO BID |
| 13 | | |
| 80W-90 MASTERPRO GEAR OIL sub must be approved by Orange County | NO BID | \$4.10 QUART |
| 14 | | |
| CONOCO 68 A W TO BE PUMPED BY VENDOR IN ORANGE COUNTY TANK NO SUBSTITUTIONS | \$663.85 DRUM | NO BID |
| 15 | | |
| ROTELLA 15 W-40 TO BE PUMPED BY VENDOR IN ORANGE NO SUBSTITUTIONS | \$936.10 DRUM | NO BID |
| 16 | | |
| DEX-COOL 50/50 PREDILUTED EXTENDED LIFE ANTI-FREEZE/COOLANT. sub must be approved by Orange County | NO BID | NO BID |

IFB-19011 OIL GREASE

| IFB-19011 OIL AND GREASE | | |
|---|------------------------|-------------|
| DESCRIPTION | CERTIFIED LABORATORIES | TRI-CON INC |
| 17 | | |
| SUPER S HIGH TEMP GREASE, 14OZ, CARTRIDGE, 12/CASE, sub must be approved by Orange County | \$194.95 CASE | NO BID |
| 18 | | |
| DURAMAX DEXTRON/MERCON 3 TRANSMISSION FLUID, 6QT/CASE, NO SUBSTITUTIONS | NO BID | NO BID |
| 19 | | |
| DEX-COLL 50/50 PREDILUTED EXTENDED LIFE ANTI-FREEZE/COOLANT, 55 GALLON DRUM, BRAND: NAPA sub must be approved by Orange County | NO BID | NO BID |
| 20 | | |
| SCHAFFER SAE 5W-20, OIL, SUPREME FULL SYNTHETIC FDEXOS 1 GEN 2 COMPLINAT ENGINE OIL, FORMULATED WITH MICRON MOLY AND PENTRO TO EXTEND ENGINE LIFE & DRAIN CAPABILITY & IMPROVE FUEL ECONOMY sub must be approved by Orange County | NO BID | NO BID |