
ORANGE COUNTY
INSTALLATION OF ON-SITE SEWAGE FACILITIES OR TIE-INS 2010

JANUARY 25, 2011
JET ADVANCED RELIABLE 802 LAPOINTE J COLE DANS ALL MELLO T JOHNSON ALCODE H & H BEAN

AERATION IRRIGATION SEPTIC ENTERPRISES ENTERPRISES AMERICAN PLUMBING INDUSTRIES INC ONSITE CONST
LLC SYSTEMS SERVICES LLC INC PLUMBING INC WASTEWATER

INC LLC SYSTEMS INC
DALE BLAND 5,200.00$     6,300.00$       5,900.00$     5,345.00$           6,680.00$           5,095.00$      7,770.00$     8,400.00$        5,740.00$      5,700.00$            6,509.00$     
4166 WEST BLUFF, ORANGE 

RILEY GIBSON 6,300.00$     7,500.00$       NO BID 5,490.00$           NO BID 5,255.00$      NO BID 9,870.00$        14,700.00$    12,645.00$          7,114.00$     
4860 N EASY, VIDOR TX

SHERYL MIZELL 4,900.00$     5,800.00$       5,800.00$     5,200.00$           5,300.00$           5,094.00$      7,370.00$     7,500.00$        5,600.00$      5,400.00$            6,980.00$     
4045 OIL PATCH, ORANGE 

PHYLISS MOORE 5,275.00$     7,000.00$       6,000.00$     6,289.00$           6,450.00$           5,255.00$      NO BID 9,148.00$        7,970.00$      5,910.00$            7,064.00$     
3460 RIVERBEND, VIDOR TX

GEORGE WILLIAMSON, SR 4,995.00$     7,000.00$       6,000.00$     6,250.00$           6,450.00$           5,294.00$      NO BID 8,740.00$        8,420.00$      6,310.00$            7,249.00$     
735 SPOONMORE, VIDOR 

JIMMY GREEN 6,000.00$     6,800.00$       6,000.00$     6,299.00$           5,950.00$           5,278.00$      8,800.00$     9,823.00$        7,500.00$      6,550.00$            7,418.00$     
5293 ATKINSON CIRCLE, 
ORANGE TX

ALFORD LAYFIELD 7,900.00$     8,300.00$       7,500.00$     7,800.00$           8,450.00$           7,266.00$      NO BID 9,090.00$        9,500.00$      7,600.00$            7,682.00$     
4510 N EASY, VIDOR TX

NATALIE TEAL 5,235.00$     7,000.00$       6,500.00$     5,545.00$           7,850.00$           5,198.00$      9,460.00$     10,200.00$      8,050.00$      7,550.00$            7,460.00$     
548 N TEAL, ORANGE TX

JOSE MUNOZ 8,900.00$     9,000.00$       NO BID 9,999.00$           8,425.00$           7,966.00$      11,670.00$   8,850.00$        12,800.00$    12,500.00$          7,605.00$     
6003 INEZ, ORANGE TX

MARY FRAZIER 4,950.00$     5,600.00$       5,900.00$     5,289.00$           6,200.00$           5,095.00$      8,460.00$     8,150.00$        5,860.00$      5,550.00$            6,795.00$     
4201 WHITE OAK, ORANGE 

JOSEPH BROWN 4,750.00$     6,200.00$       5,900.00$     5,289.00$           6,375.00$           5,095.00$      8,340.00$     8,582.00$        5,710.00$      5,550.00$            6,850.00$     
4262 WHITE OAK, ORANGE 

LUCY KIBODEAUX 5,000.00$     7,500.00$       6,500.00$     5,289.00$           6,200.00$           5,095.00$      9,070.00$     9,643.00$        7,460.00$      6,060.00$            7,310.00$     
5390 CARIBOU, ORANGE TX
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INSTALLATION OF ON-SITE SEWAGE FACILITIES OR TIE-INS 2010
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JET ADVANCED RELIABLE 802 LAPOINTE J COLE DANS ALL MELLO T JOHNSON ALCODE H & H BEAN
AERATION IRRIGATION SEPTIC ENTERPRISES ENTERPRISES AMERICAN PLUMBING INDUSTRIES INC ONSITE CONST

LLC SYSTEMS SERVICES LLC INC PLUMBING INC WASTEWATER
INC LLC SYSTEMS INC

DEANNA HEBERT 5,245.00$     6,500.00$       5,900.00$     5,350.00$           5,880.00$           5,095.00$      7,850.00$     8,376.00$        6,110.00$      5,550.00$            7,030.00$     
3120 CLAIRE, ORANGE TX

DUANE DEAN 4,750.00$     6,500.00$       5,900.00$     5,340.00$           5,850.00$           5,094.00$      7,840.00$     8,200.00$        5,710.00$      5,400.00$            7,246.00$     
3314 JERRY, ORANGE TX

JASON KIBODEAUX 5,100.00$     5,900.00$       5,800.00$     5,289.00$           5,700.00$           5,094.00$      NO BID 8,427.00$        6,230.00$      5,575.00$            6,764.00$     
500 FARA, VIDOR TX

TRINIDAD BOUDREAUX 13,200.00$   12,000.00$     NO BID 17,999.00$         NO BID 25,161.00$    NO BID 11,000.00$      23,400.00$    12,500.00$          12,796.00$   
1180 HENRY, VIDOR TX

NEAL POOL JR 5,275.00$     6,300.00$       6,500.00$     NO BID NO BID 5,395.00$      NO BID 8,800.00$        7,380.00$      6,708.00$            7,665.00$     
2225 LOVE, VIDOR TX

SHIRLEY DICKERSON 5,475.00$     5,600.00$       5,900.00$     5,389.00$           6,300.00$           5,095.00$      8,800.00$     8,278.00$        6,240.00$      5,563.00$            6,980.00$     
5005 WHITE OAK, ORANGE 

FRANKLIN WALTERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,375.00$           1,975.00$      NO BID 4,243.00$        NO BID 1,731.25$            2,120.00$     
2815 EVANGELINE, VIDOR 

ADAM DILLEY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,875.00$           1,989.50$      NO BID 2,637.00$        NO BID 1,671.25$            2,150.00$     
1180 ORANGE ST, VIDOR TX

SHERRY MYERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,950.00$           2,005.90$      NO BID 3,150.00$        NO BID 1,731.00$            2,025.00$     
540 CONCORD, VIDOR TX

SHIRLEY ROBIN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,809.00$      NO BID 2,710.00$        NO BID 1,575.00$            2,200.00$     
945 TERRY, VIDOR TX


